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Terms of Reference  - Item Number Cancer Services Feedback 
A. The funding of health services provided in NSW 

and how the funding can most effec�vely 
support the safe delivery of high quality, �mely, 
equitable and accessible pa�ent-centred care 
and health services to the people of NSW, now 
and into the future 

There needs to be more equitable funding 
distribu�on of services per capita, both inpa�ent 
and outpa�ent across the state. For example, 
several reports have shown that the 
concentra�on of inpa�ent beds (public and 
private) per capita popula�on are significantly 
reduced in the west and south-west of Sydney, 
where there are higher disease burdens and yet 
the funding models fail to adequately address 
this. This is why these hospitals feature more 
regularly when repor�ng high levels of bed block. 
And yet, when these periods occur the Ministry 
seem to imply it’s our models of care rather than 
the maldistribu�on of beds. This is exacerbated 
when access to bulk-billing GPs without having to 
wait long periods is very challenging, and hence 
pa�ents report to ED as a “free” alterna�ve. The 
solu�on to this is providing greater outpa�ent 
resources so that pa�ents can be seen in a �mely 
fashion and their problems dealt with rather 
than crisis management as pa�ents’ health has 
not been adequately addressed in a �mely 
fashion. 
 
The special needs of CALD popula�on and 
refugee popula�on as well as the non-English 
speaking pa�ent popula�on to be strongly 
included in the decision making when these 
decisions are made. Some of these popula�ons 
have high disease burden which may need extra 
funding to achieve similar outcomes as rest of 
the popula�on. The inpa�ent stay for the low 
socioeconomic group, CALD, Refugee popula�on 
is usually longer than rest of the popula�on and 
hence their social and cultural circumstances 
need to be considered when the funding 
decisions are made.  
 
Greater numbers of allied health staffing on the 
wards would also reduce admission dura�ons 
 
We need to fix the NDIS mess that results in 
prolonged admissions with no alterna�ve 
discharge plans other than wai�ng for approval. 
 
The health budget needs to beter support 
innova�on. Most budgets are set by the 
CEO/CFO based on historical expenditure (i.e. 
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retrospec�ve and reac�ve to problems). This 
leaves very litle investment in new innova�ve 
models of care that would reduce or minimise 
emergency presenta�ons. Most outpa�ent 
services provide ED avoidance strategies, 
especially when we also can use electronic 
Pa�ent Reported Outcome Measures [PROM] to 
assess pa�ent symptom burden prior to a crisis 
occurring. However, the budgetary focus is more 
and more about emergency and surgical wai�ng 
lists and access to inpa�ent care with outpa�ent 
services less well funded and prone to closures 
as there is inadequate capacity especially during 
periods of leave. 
 
SWSLHD Cancer Services have successfully 
shown a reduc�on in admission for pa�ents 
using electronic PROMs and yet the 
implementa�on has struggled due to inadequate 
funding to make this “usual care”, relying on 
contract funding rather than permanent funding. 
 
More funding needs to be made available to 
develop clinical dashboards that assess care 
equity, preferably in near real-�me. 
 
More community health treatment centres 
should be considered for funding so that the 
hospitals are mainly u�lised for acute medical 
issues and all chronic care etc. is done via these 
community treatment centres 
 
The division between state and federal funding 
creates an ar�ficial barrier and leads to 
unnecessary paper work for the clinicians adding 
more workload to their already busy schedules. 
 
An example of current inequity is the Cancer 
Gene�cs service in SWSLHD. It receives over 700 
new referrals annually and runs a high risk 
surveillance clinic for 50 pa�ents with 0.6 FTE 
staff specialist, 2 FTE associate gene�c 
counsellors and 1 FTE administra�ve staff. Since 
the last enhancement the wai�ng list has grown 
from 3 to 7 months. 
 

B.  The exis�ng governance and accountability 
structure of NSW Health, including: 
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i.  the balance between central oversight 

and locally devolved decision making 
(including the current opera�ng model 
of Local Health Districts);  

Some�mes structures are too rigid. Look for best 
prac�ce models and share across the State. 
Agree there needs to be accountability for 
financial resources without onerous repor�ng. 
 
Many Clinical Directors of a service feel they have 
very litle say on whether funding should be 
altered. The only strategy was to “bid” against 
other departments for priority funding. This 
meant that in a hospital with lots of priori�es it 
would be rare to receive the funding requested 
even when service demand alone grew 10% 
during the bidding process. The Heads of 
Department need greater say in what the service 
funding model should look like. There is also 
limited district wide approach to service 
provision and alloca�on of enhancements, many 
senior staff see themselves as advoca�ng for 
their hospital not the LHD and we are seeing 
increasing barriers put up where ra�oning of 
services based on a pa�ents LGA limi�ng care 
that pa�ents require.  
 
Review of delega�on manual to provide more 
responsibility and accountability at local level. 
 
There is maldistribu�on of resources across and 
within the LHDs, which sit at historic funding and 
do not grow with the needs of the district e.g., 
Liverpool Hospital is saturated at its capacity and 
can no longer increase its efficiency or workload 
so can’t increase its ac�vity based funding. When 
a new service opens at Campbelltown to decant 
this work from Liverpool it also is inadequately 
funded and the maldistribu�on is perpetuated. 
The complexity of care in looking a�er the 
pa�ents with non-English speaking background, 
complex social structures, poor health literacy 
and socioeconomic disadvantage are not 
captured into the funding needs. 
 
 

 ii.  the engagement and involvement of 
local communi�es in health service 
development and delivery; 

This is fundamental to ge�ng it right and should 
not be tokenis�c however o�en funding made 
available and �me is against us in doing genuine 
consulta�on. Also choosing best community 
engagement can be challenging par�cularly for 
vulnerable groups and CALD popula�ons. 
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Funding should be included for use of 
interpreters etc. for these consulta�ons and 
engagements. 
Educa�ng GPs, a large propor�on of whom are 
overseas trained doctors and do not understand 
the public health system as locally trained 
doctors. Seamless transi�on of care  should also 
occur from hospital to community. 
 
Increased use of the HealthPathway model 
developed by the South Western Sydney PHN 
and SWSLHD to support GPs to manage and refer 
pa�ents to Cancer Services 
 

 iii.  how governance structures can 
support efficient implementa�on of 
state-wide reform programs and a 
balance of system and local level needs 
and priori�es; 

The existence of eHealth NSW was designed to 
provide state-wide leadership on the planning, 
implementa�on and support of ICT and digital 
capabili�es across NSW’s public health system. 
They are accountable for eHealth across the NSW 
health system. With significant financial 
investment from NSW Government, it is 
perplexing that the Local health districts are then 
expected to pay eHealth NSW for the delivery of 
projects that will improve the workforce and/or 
the pa�ent experience in the health system. And 
in most cases, the costs are prohibi�ve: 
 

i. To create a ServiceNow form to improve 
the request for cancer EMR access or 
data extrac�on was quoted to be $5000 

ii. Projects that will clearly lead to 
improved pa�ent outcomes require a 
security assessment and a penetra�on 
test that could cost up to $70,000, with 
no  alterna�ve available to NSW public 
health departments. 

 
There is no/minimal addi�onal funding provided 
to the Local Health districts to account for the 
costs that will come from engaging eHealth NSW 
to innovate and implement tools that will 
improve workforce and/or the pa�ent 
experience. The “Cloud first” policy failed to 
recognise that LHD’s do not have the budget to 
cover the costs to implement systems in the 
cloud and to pay for the ongoing costs. eHealth 
have quoted the LHDs “at market rate” costs 
instead of “at-cost rates”.  
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Does eHealth’s financial model include making a 
profit from the LHDs that are struggling to find 
and fund staff?    
 
The investment in eHealth NSW is also 
concerning since many projects are undertaken 
by contractors who are paid extremely high 
rates, much higher than the award rates for NSW 
Health IT staff and health managers.  This then 
raises the ques�on of where the funding is going 
if the people working on projects are not 
employees of eHealth NSW; funding that is 
diverted away from NSW health system.  
 
A similar model exists from NSW Pathology 
where they are charging LHDs for work done, 
par�cularly in clinical trials research.  
 
For sub speciality services NSW health should 
fund centres of excellence for access for pa�ents 
across the state e.g., comprehensive patch 
tes�ng at Liverpool Hospital, Mohs surgery in a 
public hospital, thalassaemia and transfusion 
service where the bulk of adult pa�ents live in 
SWSLHD.  
 

  iv. the impact of priva�sa�on and 
outsourcing on the delivery of health 
services and health outcomes to the 
people of NSW; 

Monitoring required to ensure value for money 
and rigour in the contracts for same. Need to 
look for the “why” services have been priva�sed 
or outsourced to genuinely look at local funding 
gaps, staffing gaps, niche service that local 
service cannot provide or expensive services that 
could be delivered more cheaply locally. All 
outsourcing must include KPIs and repor�ng to 
ensure outcomes and safety for pa�ents. This is 
par�cularly true in rural /remote areas that 
otherwise would be without some services 
 
Public Private Partnerships (PPP) need to be 
addressed at a federal and state level. We need 
frameworks and legal consulta�on. Legisla�on 
around privacy, confiden�ality, informa�on 
sharing, consent processes are complex and 
should not be done by LHDs and individual 
departments which is inefficient and costly. For a 
PPP to be effec�ve, informa�on sharing should 
be mandatory even for the private sector 
because we know that pa�ents, even the private 
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ones, are likely to atend emergency 
departments in the public health system and we 
have no informa�on on them. In haematology 
and oncology, without knowing with accuracy 
what chemotherapy a pa�ent has had or what 
radia�on doses to what areas of the body a 
pa�ent has had, we could inadvertently cause 
harm to our pa�ents. The state and federal 
governments have to find a way to allow 
informa�on sharing using the pla�orms that 
millions of dollars has been poured into i.e. 
HealtheNet and My health record. Public private 
partnerships are not a blanket solu�on for all of 
NSW. The government needs to look at the 
demographic of the pa�ents in the various LHDs 
around the state to determine where to focus 
these efforts for maximum gain otherwise, we 
waste �me and effort. 
 
In terms of radia�on oncology there have been 
challenges related to the sudden prolifera�on of 
private oncology services. Some private services 
have been established well whereas others have 
not considered the models of care required for a 
comprehensive suite of services for pa�ents 
including no ready access to inpa�ent beds when 
required and litle or no access to care co-
ordina�on and allied health services. This is bad 
for pa�ent care. In addi�on, informa�on 
regarding the pa�ent care has become more 
fragmented. 
 
In radia�on oncology, the Department of 
Statewide services used to strategically plan the 
distribu�on of radia�on oncology services. 
However, this no longer seems to be the case 
with a very large upswing in the provision of 
private radia�on oncology services. While there 
should always be the op�ons available for 
pa�ents to access both public and private this 
upswing has resulted in challenges for public 
radia�on oncology services, which partly rely on 
pa�ent ac�vity to fund ongoing research efforts. 
The risk will be a reduc�on in academic radia�on 
oncology, similar to what has occurred with the 
widespread priva�sa�on of radiology services, 
with litle academic radiology prac�ce going on. 
This is ul�mately bad for pa�ent care as 
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innova�on and clinical trials ac�vity have both 
been shown to improve pa�ent outcomes.  
 
The unco-ordinated prolifera�on of private 
radia�on oncology services, occasionally with 
even 3 providers within the same postcode, has 
resulted in a demand on recruitment of radia�on 
therapy and medical physics staff that exceeds 
the current supply of graduates and a number of 
public radia�on oncology departments have 
been unsuccessful in recruitment. Perversely this 
will lead to wai�ng lists for care in public facili�es 
which then further encourages private use. The 
planning of these services needs much greater 
co-ordina�on and considera�on of the needs of 
pa�ents for both high-quality public and private 
oncology services. The investment into public 
radia�on oncology departments to keep up with 
demand has been lacking and this would be a 
shame for it to deteriorate further. 
Further engagement with private providers to 
inform planning of resources for public hospitals 
to op�mise efficiencies.  E.g., 3 PET machines in 
Campbelltown in near future – the public 
hospital PET machine is not funded for staffing 
and poten�ally will be redundant 
 
The limita�on of private providers in SWSLHD 
places an unequal burden on already stretched 
public services. With respect to dermatology 
access affordability for private dermatology 
services in the district are highly constrained. 
Currently, there are 0.86 FTE dermatologists per 
100,000 thousand popula�on in South West 
Sydney against approximately 6.0 FTE per 
100,000 in the Eastern suburbs of Sydney.  
To meet the state average of 2.1 FTE 
dermatologists, currently need 22.0 FTE 
dermatologists to service the popula�on of 1.1 
million people in the district. 
 
Currently there is one private Cancer Gene�cs 
specialist provider in Sydney, with their prac�ce 
located in Sydney city and northern Sydney area. 
As such, this is not readily accessible for face to 
face appointments for residents of SWSLHD. The 
out of pocket costs associated with atending a 
private clinic also mean that this has litle impact 
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on wait �mes for the Cancer Gene�cs clinic at 
Liverpool Hospital. 
 
Currently, there is availability for limited 
ini�a�on of germline gene�c tes�ng by non-
gene�cs specialists (mainstream gene�c tes�ng) 
which is guided by MBS eligibility criteria. These 
item numbers are theore�cally available for use 
by specialists in the private sector, but in 
prac�ce, we have seen litle evidence of this 
occurring in SWSLHD.  
 

  v.    how governance structures can 
support a sustainable workforce and 
delivery of high quality, �mely, 
equitable and accessible pa�ent-
centred care to improve the health of 
the NSW popula�on;  

Governance is key to any improvement in 
outcomes, from our perspec�ve there is litle or 
no co-ordina�on between the state and the 
universi�es regarding placement numbers for 
undergraduates. This is especially problema�c 
currently in radia�on therapy, ever since Sydney 
University closed their programme, meaning that 
Newcastle Uni is the only undergraduate 
opportunity in NSW. This needs to be fixed 
 
Provision of flexible working op�ons – use of 
temporary locums to cover leave to preserve 
staff wellbeing and ensure a constant service. 
 
The governance should be centralised with 
leaves, on call rosters, PMR etc., being managed 
by the director of the networked clinical services 
 
More involvement of the consumers, trea�ng 
medical and nursing team will give them more 
empowerment that the local needs are being 
heard and appropriate ac�on is being taken as 
per the needs of the pa�ents 

C.  The way NSW Health funds health services 
delivered in public hospitals and community 
se�ngs, and the extent to which this alloca�on 
of resources supports or obstructs access to 
preventa�ve and community health ini�a�ves 
and overall op�mal health outcomes for all 
people across NSW;  

The current focus for budget in NSW remains 
solving ED wai�ng �mes. But atemp�ng to fix 
this solely with more beds or “more efficient” 
models of care will not work without inves�ng in 
the services required to reduce ED demand such 
as availability of outpa�ent services including 
allied health and all major medical special�es. 
There has been litle investment in outpa�ent 
during my �me in SWSLHD. 
 
Sub speciality centre of excellence in the state 
will improve the quality-of-care pa�ents receive 
such as for low volume cancers. 
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Hospital funding for staff specialists and trainees 
should respond to current and projected needs 
of the district. This need should include 
popula�on growth but also requirements of 
increased scope of service e.g., Paediatric 
dermatology in South Western Syndey Local 
Health district has currently 10,000 babies born 
annually, further given a large popula�on of first 
genera�on immigrants with a higher incidence of 
eczema in this popula�on. The pa�ents from 
lower economics status have poor health 
outcomes. SWSLHD also has a large number of 
trade persons and other outdoor jobs who have 
a high risk of skin cancers form the cumula�ve 
sun exposure.  
 
The iden�fica�on of a hereditary cancer 
predisposi�on syndrome provides informa�on to 
primary and community health ini�a�ves to 
improve health outcomes for individuals and 
families at increased risk, through educa�on 
regarding cancer risks and strategies to prevent 
cancer or assist in early detec�on through 
screening. Restric�ng �mely access to cancer 
gene�cs services through long waitlists and/or 
centralisa�on of services to selected hospitals (in 
the case of SWSLHD, to Liverpool Hospital) is 
therefore not in line with achieving op�mal 
health outcomes in this local health district. The 
SWSLHD Cancer Gene�cs is rela�vely less well 
resourced (in terms of staffing) compared with 
other familial cancer clinics in Sydney, which 
works to exacerbate the health dispari�es 
between SWS and other LHDs. 
 
Beter funding of GP prac�ces and models to 
reduce ED presenta�ons to restrict to complex, 
urgent cases 
 
Currently much of the focus is on achieving the 
ED targets for admission/review. Hence the focus 
is on crea�ng more acute bed space and 
discharging pa�ents etc. The focus needs to shi� 
to whole of pa�ent care/health where the acute 
hospital se�ngs, outpa�ent se�ngs, community 
se�ngs for care are also managed. 50% of cancer 
pa�ents in SWSLHD do not start chemotherapy 
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within na�onal benchmark standards, so access 
to care needs to be considered for areas other 
than ED and elec�ve surgery. 
 
Consulta�ve services such as pallia�ve care need 
to be considered as consult services do not 
atract funding .Biggest obstruc�on is the State 
and Commonwealth divide which effects services 
pa�ents may be able to access, medica�ons and 
equipment. 

 D.  Strategies available to NSW Health to address 
escala�ng costs, limit wastage, minimise 
overservicing and iden�fy gaps or areas of 
improvement in financial management and 
proposed recommenda�ons to enhance 
accountability and efficiency;  

Service /facility efficiencies in discharge 
planning/ discharge/transport. O�en many 
inefficiencies that have pa�ents wai�ng to get 
home etc  
 
We would recommend investment in preven�on 
and early detec�on, suppor�ng value-based care 
of radiotherapy, u�lising generic drugs, 
nego�a�ng drug prices using a healthshare 
pla�orm similar to nego�a�ng for all 
radiotherapy departments, using more of 
telemedicine and advocacy for policy changes 
that addressed the high costs areas 
 
Regular review of inpa�ent tests requested, 
restric�ng ordering of certain imaging to certain 
providers (e.g., PET scan) to reduce significant 
costs where prac��oners are not adop�ng or 
implemen�ng models to eliminate Low Value 
Care. 
 
Educa�on and training of the local community – 
community leaders, GPs, nurses and eventually 
focus on preventa�ve strategies to improve the 
health of the popula�on. 
 
The cost of germline gene�c tes�ng has 
decreased markedly over recent years. 
Improvements in technology allowing mul�ple 
simultaneous gene tes�ng (panel, exome or 
genome) have enhanced the cost efficiency. In 
some circumstances, improving access to gene�c 
assessment and tes�ng has the capacity to 
provide more accurate cancer risk assessment. 
Individuals with an iden�fiable hereditary cancer 
syndrome can access evidence based screening 
with the capacity to diagnosed cancer at earlier 
state or prevent cancer. Both of these strategies 



NSW Government 
Special Commission of Inquiry into Healthcare Funding 

South West Sydney LHD- Cancer Services.  
 

Page | 11 
 

Terms of Reference  - Item Number Cancer Services Feedback 
can reduce the overall cost to the health system 
and treatment costs are minimised. 
 
There are limita�ons in the custom germline 
gene�c panels available through NSW Health 
Pathology.  
 

E.  Opportuni�es to improve NSW Health 
procurement process and prac�ce, to enhance 
support for opera�onal decision-making, 
service planning and delivery of quality and 
�mely health care, including considera�on of 
supply chain disrup�ons;  

Medica�on access and drugs no longer being 
manufactured and sourcing new supply chains of 
cri�cal medicines i.e. oral morphine liquid 
 
Substan�al �me is wasted on extensive 
paperwork, chasing signatures, finding addi�onal 
funding.  A cost analysis on the process will 
reveal that thousands of dollars are wasted per 
day across the health system which places even 
more strain because the staff, in many cases, are 
taken away from their BAU ac�vi�es. Just like 
there are KPIs around recruitment �mes, there 
should be KPIs around other aspects of approval 
processes. 
 
Allow for more compe��ve process with less 
reliance on “monopoly” providers – although 
unavoidable in some cases.  e.g., Slade pharmacy 
– inves�gate whether poten�al for self-
compounding.  Use of LHD wide agreements – 
currently different agreements for different 
hospitals with discounts given to some, not 
others. 
 
Over the past few years, there have been 
increasing delays in the turnaround �me for 
gene�c test results to be made available. The 
outcome of uncertain and lengthening 
turnaround �mes for tests from a clinical 
perspec�ve is Time wasted chasing up results; 
Pa�ent anxiety whilst awai�ng several months 
for results; expira�on of referrals whilst awai�ng 
gene�c test results with unnecessary �me spent 
by pa�ents seeking out new referrals and 
unnecessary costs to the health service 
subsidising appointments rela�ng purely to 
obtaining referral leters. 
 
Advice from the NSW Health Pathology sites will 
be able to clarify the causes for and poten�al 
solu�ons to these issues, which certainly recently 
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have also included supply chain disrup�ons in 
addi�on to other causes. 
 

F.  The current capacity and capability of the NSW 
Health workforce to meet the current needs of 
pa�ents and staff, and its sustainability to meet 
future demands and deliver efficient, equitable 
and effec�ve health services, including:  

Workforce reviews required for specific cra� 
groups/disciplines and using popula�on 
methodology projec�ng future needs of FTE 
 
We feel there needs to be more allied health and 
nursing staff enhancement to meet the 
demands. In our opinion there is more than 
adequate specialists being trained currently. This 
should reduce the reliance of the more 
expensive doctor led clinics and implement 
models of care with task transfer to equally well 
trained nursing and AH staff. 

 i.  the distribu�on of health workers in 
NSW;  

Reviewing FTE against popula�on based 
approach ,including future forecas�ng 
popula�on and benchmarking across and within 
LHDs. There is a need to address the insufficient 
health workforce in regional centres. 
 
The current dermatology workforce in SWSLHD is 
significantly under resourced, hyper frac�onated 
at 0.1-0.2 FTE. There is a clear maldistribu�on of 
the dermatology workforce in NSW as the 
funding sits at historical levels while the 
popula�on growth is highest in SWSLHD due to 
increasing cost of living pressures 

 
The workforce planning should be based on 
current and projected popula�on of the area and 
special needs with respect to the diversity of the 
demographics e.g. Cultural and linguis�c 
diversity , socio economic disadvantage , health 
co morbidi�es 
 
The Cancer Gene�cs clinic at Liverpool Hospital, 
SWSLHD, is one of the most poorly resourced 
familial cancer services in NSW. It receives over 
700 new pa�ent referrals each year in addi�on to 
managing a high risk surveillance clinic for 50 
women at high gene�c risk of breast/ovarian 
cancer. It is staffed by 0.6 FTE staff specialist, 2 
FTE associate gene�c counsellors and 1 FTE 
administra�ve staff. The number of referrals has 
more than doubled from 2017 to 2023, and 
increased by 22% since 2020, which is when the 
last staffing enhancement (increase in staff 
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specialist frac�on from 0.3 to 0.6 FTE) occurred. 
The number of women accessing the high risk 
clinic has more than doubled since 2020. 
The lengthening waitlist �mes impact on the 
service’s ability to deliver �mely care to referred 
pa�ents and families.  
 
The distribu�on of health workers in the familial 
cancer field is not even based on the popula�ons 
serviced within NSW and exacerbates inequi�es 
in health care for SWSLHD residents compared to 
other LHDs. 
 
This needs a detailed review as many health care 
workers in south west Sydney are aware that the 
pa�ent to doctor ra�o in SWSLHD is significantly 
different to other inner city LHDs. This is one 
area the equity needs to be looked into and 
ac�oned  
 
The health care workers posi�ons need to be 
funded as per the local need rather than as per 
the current process of funding as per the LHD 
financial health   

 ii.  an examina�on of exis�ng skills 
shortages; 

We need to understand the ‘why’ ( linked to 
training numbers, new grad job numbers, 
overseas trained staff who cannot register ) 
 
We have exis�ng skill shortage of radia�on 
therapists across NSW (and Australia), and have 
atempted to make representa�on with the 
Ministry regarding engagement with University 
to provide an undergraduate or post-graduate 
program within Sydney to mi�gate this shortage 
 
Investment in the upskilling of the specialist and 
generalist doctors is required for skin cancer 
management. Funding and placement of 
Interna�onal Medical Graduates can be a 
poten�al speedy solu�on. 
 
Equalising the grading across all LHD posi�ons 
would improve staff reten�on. For example, 
gene�c counsellors in SWSLHD are usually 
recruited as Level 1 counsellors that have just 
completed their Masters of Gene�c Counselling 
Degrees. They require a high degree of training 
and cannot work independently. By contrast 
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other Cancer Gene�cs (Familial or Hereditary 
Cancer) services frequently have long term level 
3 or above Cer�fied Gene�c Counsellors. Staff 
will leave for beter paid posi�ons in other LHDs 
 
 
 
 
There is significant shortage of chemotherapy 
accredited nursing staff across SWSLHD. With 
more private cancer centres coming into the 
area, this problem will be further heightened. 
The need for senior skilled nursing staff for 
haematology is significant 

  iii.  evalua�ng financial and non-financial 
factors impac�ng on the reten�on and 
atrac�on of staff; 

More workforce strategies that take staff 
feedback seriously, need exit interview data to 
limit future loss of staff. Staff in health generally 
do not want pay incen�ves, they want equity of 
staffing so they have the same level of support 
that other staff have in other LHD’s- admin, 
nursing and allied health support are examples.  
 
Enhancements to services has been lacking 
despite the NSW government being aware that 
the pa�ent numbers and occasions of services is 
rapidly increasing in NSW health. The ABF model 
is either not highligh�ng this growth or it is and 
NSW Health and government is not asking the 
ques�on of how the system is coping. Reducing 
lengths of stays is not going to work for 
chronically ill pa�ents and the risk of re-
admission is high. The staff are overworked and 
at risk of burnout. Many staff across NSW are 
doing more, seeing more pa�ents, working 
(unpaid/invisible) over-�me to get through the 
workload and this will not be evident in the 
ac�vity data. And the staff do this because they 
care about their pa�ents. In some cases, private 
prac�ce trust funds have been funding extra 
posi�ons to keep up with the demand and this is 
not a sustainable solu�on. Applying for grants to 
bolster resources to do innova�ve work for NSW 
pa�ents is �me consuming, compe��ve and is 
also non-sustainable as the ability to embed and 
upscale o�en needs staff enhancements which 
do not follow. It also does not provide staff with 
job security and leads to high turnaround of 
employees which is disrup�ve to a service.  
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Staff reten�on is a major problem also due to the 
lack of flexibility in work arrangements in the 
public health system and the wage gap between 
the different states for the same/similar roles. 
 
In a socioeconomically disadvantaged popula�on 
the affordability of accessing private medical  
services for chronic diseases is constrained which 
pushes more work to public facili�es of EDs. 
Affordability and the fee structure also 
determines desirability of a specialist working in 
an area in private. 
 
NSW has the lowest wage structure  in health 
care, highest cost of living including 
accommoda�on and transport not to add travel 
�mes of at least an hour each way resul�ng in 
migra�on of staff interstate to overcome these 
challenges. Significant incen�ves need to be 
introduced to recruit and retain staff. 
 
Without senior workforce there can be a lack of 
on site support; high workload for early career 
staff; minimal �me within work hours to consider 
ongoing training career development 
requirements and less opportunity for research 
 
SWSLHD may not be preferred for staff living 
more distantly from the workplace, who then 
seek opportuni�es closer to their home.  
 
We can retain medical physicists and radia�on 
oncologist but we are short of ability and 
financial incen�ves to retain radia�on therapists 
 
The workload is significant for burnout of health 
care workers in SWSLHD and this needs to be 
balanced 

  iv.  exis�ng employment standards;  The dermatology work force in SWSLHD is highly 
frac�onated , at 0.1-0.2FTE  reducing 
engagement and most staff working longer hours 
to reduce wait lists  
 
The financial remunera�on is same for a posi�on 
in NSW Health. In SWSLHD for the same 
remunera�on, a health care worker would be 
doing significantly more than their peer in other 
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LHDs. The work load needs to be considered in 
the funding structure 

 v.  the role and scope of workforce 
accredita�on and registra�on; 

As per ii some processes for medicine are long 
and complex  
 
The accredita�on process is quite onerous and 
�me consuming, this can some�mes act as a 
deterrent to anyone but the most mo�vated 
person. 
 

  vi. the skill mix, distribu�on and scope of 
prac�ce of the health workforce;  

In Gynaecological Oncology and Head and Neck 
Cancer surgery, there is absence of exper�se 
placement and skill mix across the state with 
surgeons working at Lifehouse, and not wan�ng 
to work out of central Sydney. 
 
The majority of nurse care coordinators in 
SWSLHD, a standard of cancer care, are funded 
by philanthropy [McGrath and Prostate Cancer 
Founda�on] with risks of reten�on as these are 
short term contracts if doubt of future reliable 
funding.  
 

 vii.  the use of locums, Visi�ng Medical 
Officers, agency staff and other 
temporary staff arrangements;  

Guidelines and rules required to ensure not used 
as easier op�on but for genuine service gaps 
such as prolonged sick, long service and parental 
leave. The amount of money spent of locums 
could easily be transferred into permanent salary 
and wages for some departments.  
 
The mix of VMO and Staff specialists (in 
Radia�on Oncology) don’t work quite well in 
regional NSW. 
 
Provide incen�ves to partner with rural services 
for trainee secondments to increase likelihood of 
long term rural placements 
 
This is unavoidable due to the long  drawn 
process of recruitment where approval for 
recruitment is required even against a 
resigna�on crea�ng further stress in terms of 
work load management. 
 
 

 viii.  the rela�onship between NSW Health 
agencies and medical prac��oners;  

NSW health needs to be engaging with the 
doctors on the coalface for input into policies 
that shape funding. 
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Upscaling worthy and award winning projects 
coming out of the ACI or CEC across LHDs would 
be important to improve efficiencies or pa�ent 
care state wide, not just in the one LHD that 
implemented the project.  
 
The issue of eHealth charging LHDs for work that 
LHDs are unable to tender for is wasteful. 
  

 ix.  opportuni�es for an expanded scope of 
prac�ce for paramedics, community and 
allied health workers, nurses and/or 
midwives;  

There is a need to enhance and increase the role 
of Nurse Prac��oners in improving pa�ent care, 
safety and efficiency. Some examples include; 
run a follow up or survivorship clinic in parallel or 
in conjunc�on with specialist clinic improving 
new pa�ents being seen in a �mely manner (less 
than 2 weeks from referral); assess unwell 
pa�ents (ED bypass service); facilita�on of 
mainstream germline gene�c tes�ng pathways to 
assist in �mely iden�fica�on and tes�ng by non-
gene�cs specialists; assist in coordina�on of the 
high risk surveillance clinic, which is currently 
managed by the staff specialist 
 
Beter u�lisa�on and upskilling of the allied work 
force to deliver meaningful educa�on , 
reassurance at first point of care and ingoing 
reitera�on for management of chronic diseases 
will likely improve long term outcomes 
 

 x.  the role of mul�-disciplinary community 
health services in mee�ng current and 
future demand and reducing pressure 
on the hospital system; 

Explore need to provide extended hours services 
and home visi�ng par�cularly with declining GP 
availability 7 days per week; implemen�ng a 
virtual care nurse led model for advice should 
limit presenta�ons to ED or readmission rates. 
Without an a�er hours GP service the default is 
to present to ED.   
 
SWSLHD has been working with local PHN to 
share the ongoing FU between GP and specialists 
such as a shared care model with community 
health services (e.g., breast cancer follow/up) 
 
There is a need to deliver culturally sensi�ve, 
appropriate, at home care for vulnerable 
communi�es of the First Na�ons people and first 
genera�on immigrants with limited mobility and 
language skills 
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We think it is important to have discussions with 
the community and look at reducing the hospital 
presenta�ons and preventa�ve health should be 
a major focus 
 

  xi.  opportuni�es and quality of care 
outcomes in maintaining direct 
employment arrangements with health 
workers;   

Nurse prac��oners will be a huge help in NSW 
Health. Victoria health has huge number of nurse 
prac��oners. We do not have any nurse 
prac��oners in cancer services and this is a huge 
gap to fill 

G.  Current educa�on and training programs for 
specialist clinicians and their sustainability to 
meet future needs, including:  

For SWSLHD this is perhaps the greatest 
challenge 

 i.  placements;  Need to also look at specialist nursing and allied 
health and access to funding training, 
conferences etc. Drs have TESL, others have self 
funded or perhaps scholarship support if lucky  
 
We currently don’t have posi�ons to offer 
Fellowship within Radia�on Oncology. Most 
departments use their private prac�ce trust 
funds to support the Fellowship program which 
is unsuitable. 
 
Trainee placements are determined by the NSW 
faculty and the hospital has no say in the 
selec�on and placement of trainees in some 
special�es. Placements should consider needs of 
the service and poten�al workforce solu�ons in 
addi�on to training needs of an individual. It is a 
difficult balance between trainee autonomy 
selec�on and providing service to popula�ons 
within NSW. In general the well resourced LHDs 
with supernumerary fellow posi�ons fill their 
trainee component first whilst outer metro, rural 
and remote have to cover vacancies. A full 
stocktake of all registrar and staff specialist 
posi�ons based on the popula�on of an LHD 
needs to be taken to address this inequity. 
 

 ii.  the way training is offered and overseen 
(including for interna�onally trained 
specialists); 

The Interna�onal Medical Graduate recruitment 
is burdensome with too many hoops to jump 
through par�cularly establishing an area of need. 
 
In general the training provided in NSW Health 
for medical specialists is excellent and admired 
by rest of the world, it is the appropriate 
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distribu�on of these training roles that needs 
addressing.  
 

 iii.  how colleges support and respond to 
escala�ng community demand for 
services; 

Colleges do not see themselves as solu�on 
providers for work force issues as Fellows of 
Colleges cannot be forced to work in an area of 
need [AON]. However proper selec�on and 
placement of trainees in an AON can help 
address the maldistribu�on of the workforce to 
select and train registrars from the area so that 
they can return to work in the area . 

 
As Cancer Gene�cs crosses 2 current speciali�es 
(tradi�onally more closely aligned with Clinical 
Gene�cs although the training profile is changing 
over �me), and is a rela�vely small specialty in 
terms of number of specialists, it has been hard 
to advocate for a recognised training pathway 
that addresses the needs for Cancer Gene�cs as 
a specific and growing area of need. 
 

  iv.  the engagement between medical 
colleges and local health districts and 
speciality health networks;  

Limited engagement by colleges with LHD and 
unrealis�c expecta�ons re training requirements 
and opera�onal requirements.  Beter “real 
world” engagement required by colleges to 
prepare trainees for working environment. Some 
accredita�on reports seem to be at the whim 
and biases of the assessors as we are aware of 
other sites not receiving nega�ve 
recommenda�ons for iden�cal work condi�ons.  
 
This needs to be improved as the College of 
Dermatologists has a na�onal selec�on process 
and is not always aware of needs of a district, the 
number of training posi�ons they offer are not 
matching demand.  
 
Training opportuni�es are limited to the 4 largest 
Cancer Gene�cs in Sydney. There are 2 x 1.0 FTE 
posi�ons for advanced trainees in Cancer 
Gene�cs in NSW, and these are shared between 
Prince of Wales Hospital, Westmead Hospital, 
Royal Prince Alfred Hospital and Royal North 
Shore Hospital. NSW Health need to fund more 
posi�ons and the College need to accredit more 
posi�ons.  
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 v.  how barriers to workforce expansion 

can be addressed to increase the 
supply, accessibility and affordability of 
specialist clinical services in healthcare 
workers in NSW;  

Benchmarking across all LHDs based on the 
workforce supply needed for a popula�on also 
taking into account some loading needed for low 
volume rare quaternary services. Looking at all 
staff employed at all levels to provide 
transparency is crucial to iden�fying 
maldistribu�on of staffing especially as the more 
established hospitals have had historical funding 
when they were providing services for WSLHD 
and SWSLHD.  

 
The investment in funding for JMOs and 
registrars from the area to train in the area to 
meet the unique health needs of the 
demographic and feel confident to return to the 
area to work. 
 
To address barriers to workforce expansion to 
achieve parity requires funding. Addi�onal 
staffing will allow accessibility to specialist 
services and improve access to affordable 
specialist services within the public health 
system to allow implementa�on of the SWSLHD 
locally endorsed One Service Multiple Sites 
Model of Care. 
 
The main barrier is financial and support from 
the LHD to look at the need for new posi�ons 
and expansion of clinical services where the need 
is. This requires input from the 9 LHD Clinical 
Directors to advice on enhancement priori�es 
rather than which facility director can influence a 
local general manager or a local Clinical Council.  
 

H.  New models of care and technical and clinical 
innova�ons to improve health outcomes for the 
people of NSW, including but not limited to 
technical and clinical innova�on, changes to 
scope of prac�ce, workforce innova�on, and 
funding innova�on 

In a speciality like haematology, intensive 
treatments are o�en performed as an inpa�ent 
and pa�ents spend a lot of �me in the hospital. If 
there was funding for outpa�ent management 7 
days a week the majority of these pa�ents can 
spend �me at their own home and come for 
review frequently in outpa�ent se�ngs.  
 
However the funding for this service has not 
been a priority for the health services as 
inpa�ents are the main priority. Pa�ent care as a 
whole need to be the main focus when the 
funding is decided. 

 




